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Comments on the CESR-ESCB Draft Standards on Clearing & Settlement

Dear Mr Moeliker,
Dear Mr Kazarian,

We would like to thank you for the possibility to comment on the ESCB-CESR Draft Standards on
Clearing & Settlement.

As you can see from our letter-head, the Association of Foreign Banks in Germany represents the
interests of foreign banks, investment management companies, financial services institutions and
representative offices in Germany. Members of the Association of Foreign Banks in Germany serve a
diverse base of financial intermediaries and investors, not only institutions active within Germany but
also those which have significant interest in investment and securities services across the European
Union. A list of the Association’s members is attached.

The Standards for securities clearing and settlement systems in the European Union proposed by the
CESR-ESCB working group aim to reduce risk in clearing and settlement of securities in the EU. The
Association fully supports this objective but makes the following proposal:

Proposal:

The Standards should not apply the concepts of “systematically important systems” and “dominant
provider” relative to custodians for any of the purposes alluded to in the Standards and should not
be addressed to custodians engaged in settlement of client transactions in the EU.

The proposed Standards intend to cover both infrastructures (central securities depositories and central
counterparties) and custodian banks. Where a custodian processes a large volume of settlements relative
to the total size of the relevant market, the Standards propose to regulate them in the same way as
infrastructures.
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Infrastructures serve the entire market and custodians offer services in a highly competitive environment.
They also have different legal status, which result in different risks. To attempt to regulate custodians the
same way as infrastructures is inappropriate, because both the functions and the nature of risks are
different.

It should be noticed that infrastructures belong to the field of Services of General Economic Interest. As a
result, they should be ring-fenced against systemic and financial risk, and prevented from using their
dominant position to spoil the competitive domain. Distortion of competition could occur because
infrastructures enjoy privileges in their relationships with market regulators, market authorities and other
market infrastructures, which are not available to commercial enterprises.

Furthermore, infrastructures were designed to service the entire market place and benefit from an
incumbent situation which no competitor can possibly match. This position, combined with market
knowledge, as well as tuning of the infrastructure and bundling strategies, can be used with great effect to
sell the CSD and ICSD intermediary services.

It is worthwhile noting that non-custodian market players of a significant size could also be considered
"systemically important", whether they are accessing the infrastructures directly or through an
intermediary. The Standards are silent on this point.

The Association agrees that the effects of systemic risks are undesirable and such risks should be
appropriately regulated. However, infrastructures serve the entire market and custodians offer services in
a highly competitive environment. They also have different legal status which results in different risks. To
attempt to regulate custodians the same way as infrastructures is inappropriate, because both the functions
and the nature of risks are different.

Custodian banks are already regulated in respect of all material aspects of their business which can give
rise to internally-generated failure of their settlement functions (e.g. failure of systems or credit risk
management). In addition, custodians will in due course have to comply with regulatory capital
requirements in respect of operational risk under the Basel II proposals, which cover potential impacts on
payment and securities systems.

Other factors which may influence systemic risk are of external origin and thus outside the control of the
custodian bank. These factors are principally concerned with the effect of insolvency proceedings of a
market participant, which can have seriously disruptive effects on settlement finality and certainty of
contractual arrangements. Additional regulation would not reduce these external risks.

By contrast, the main operators of clearing and settlement systems (CCPs and CSDs) are not subject to
any uniform EU-wide regulatory standards, and such standards for these infrastructures would be
desirable. The Association considers that the new Standards should be applied in the first place to
operators of such infrastructures - where there is currently no regulatory benchmark. This is consistent
with the CPSS IOSCO recommendations on which the Standards are based. Historically, CSDs have not
been entitled to take credit risk because of their core market function and this remains a worldwide
practice.

Only where systemic issues related to custodians are demonstrably not adequately addressed by their
existing regulatory system should additional regulations be considered and these should be within their
existing regulatory system.

Classifying a custodian as "systemically important" might have the competitive implications of
pronouncing it as, effectively, "too big to fail". In addition, the significant cost of compliance with the
Standards could lead smaller custodians to exit the business, leading to increased concentration of risk
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and reduced competition. These are the unintended but probable consequences if the proposed Standards
are enforced.

In general the use of the Standards report and concepts relating to "systemically important systems" and
"dominant provider" should not be employed relative to custodians for any of the purposes alluded to in
the Standards. Virtually all Standards should be addressed exclusively to CSDs, ICSDs, and CCPs and
not to custodians engaged in settlement of client transactions in the EU.

We regret that we are not able to participate at the CESR-ESCB hearing on October 2, 2003 in Paris but
we would be very grateful if you could supply us with the relevant information on the results of the
meeting and the further steps to be taken in this matter.

Yours sincerely

  (Jens Tolckmitt)     (Markus Erb)

Enclosure
Members of the Association
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Ägypten/Egypt Misr Bank-Europe GmbH 

Australien/Australia Australia and New Zealand Banking Group Ltd. Niederlassung Frankfurt/Main

Bahrain Arab Banking Corporation - Daus & Co. GmbH

Belgien/Belgium Fortis Bank Niederlassung Deutschland

KBC Bank Deutschland AG 

Brasilien/Brazil Banco do Brasil S.A. Zweigniederlassung Frankfurt/Main

China Industrial and Commercial Bank of China Niederlassung Frankfurt

Dänemark/Denmark Danske Bank Zweigniederlassung Hamburg

Nordea Bank Finland Plc Niederlassung Deutschland

Frankreich/France BNP PARIBAS INVEST GmbH 

BNP Paribas Lease Group S.A. Zweigniederlassung Deutschland

BNP Paribas S.A. Niederlassung Frankfurt am Main

BNP PARIBAS Securities Services Zweigniederlassung Frankfurt am Main

BOURSORAMA S.A. Zweigniederlassung Frankfurt am Main

CDC IXIS Zweigniederlassung Deutschland

Consors Discount-Broker AG 

Crédit Agricole Indosuez Niederlassung Frankfurt

Credit Lyonnais Frankfurt am Main 

Fimat International Banque S.A. Zweigniederlassung Frankfurt

Natexis Banques Populaires Niederlassung Deutschland

Société Générale S.A. 

Griechenland/Greece Agricultural Bank of Greece S.A. 

Commercial Bank of Greece (Germany) GmbH 

Großbritannien/Great Britain Bank of Scotland Zweigniederlassung Frankfurt

Barclays Bank PLC Frankfurt Branch

Delta Lloyd Investment Managers GmbH 

Garban Intercapital Securities Deutschland GmbH

Gartmore Investment Services GmbH 

INVESCO Bank OHG 

Riggs Bank Europe Limited Niederlassung Berlin

Schroder & Co. Ltd. Frankfurt Branch 

Schroder Investment Management GmbH 

The Royal Bank of Scotland plc Niederlassung Frankfurt

Threadneedle Investment Services 

Indien/India State Bank of India Zweigniederlassung Frankfurt am Main

Iran Bank Melli Iran 

Bank Sepah-Iran 
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Irland/Ireland Bank of Ireland Asset Management

Merrill Lynch Capital Markets Bank Limited Zweigniederlassung Frankfurt am Main

Italien/Italy Banca di Roma S.p.A. Zweigniederlassung Frankfurt am Main

Banca Popolare di Bergamo -  Credito Varesino S.C.R.L.

IntesaBci SpA Niederlassung Frankfurt am Main

SANPAOLO IMI BANK SPA Filiale Frankfurt am Main

Japan Daiwa Securities SMBC Europe Limited 

Mizuho Corporate Bank (Germany) AG 

Mizuho Corporate Bank Ltd. 

MTBC Bank Deutschland GmbH 

NOMURA BANK (Deutschland) GmbH 

Sumitomo Mitsui Banking Corporation 

The Bank of Tokyo-Mitsubishi Ltd. Frankfurt Branch

Tokyo-Mitsubishi International plc Frankfurt Branch

UFJ Bank Ltd. Filiale Düsseldorf

Jordanien/Jordan Arab Bank AG 

Kanada/Canada Maple Bank GmbH 

Niederlande/Netherlands ABN AMRO Bank N.V. Niederlassung Deutschland

Agricredit GmbH 

Demir Halk Bank (Nederland) N.V. Filiale Düsseldorf

Fortis Bank (Nederland) N.V. Frankfurt Branch

GarantiBank International N.V. Niederlassung Düsseldorf

Rabobank International Frankfurt Branch Zweigniederlassung Frankfurt

Robeco Asset Management (Deutschland) B.V. 

Norwegen/Norway Den norske Bank ASA Filiale Deutschland

Österreich/Austria Oberbank AG, Linz Zweigniederlassung Bayern

Salzburg München Bank AG 

Rumänien/Romania Frankfurt Bukarest Bank AG 

Russland/Russia Ost-West Handelsbank AG 

Schweden/Sweden Enskilda Securities AB Frankfurt Branch

SEB AG 

Svenska Handelsbanken AB (publ) Niederlassung Frankfurt am Main

Schweiz/Switzerland AIG Private Bank 

Bank Julius Bär (Deutschland) AG 

Bank von Ernst Deutschland Repräsentanz

Credit Suisse (Deutschland) AG 

Credit Suisse Asset Management Kapitalanlagegesellschaft mbH

Credit Suisse Asset Management (Deutschland) GmbH

Credit Suisse First Boston (Europe) Limited 

GAM Fonds Marketing GmbH 

Julius Bär Kapitalanlage AG 

UBS Beteiligungs-GmbH & Co. KG 

UBS Investment Bank AG 

UBS Wealth Management  AG 

Slowenien/Slovenia LHB Internationale Handelsbank AG 
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Spanien/Spain Banco Santander Central Hispano, S.A. Filiale Frankfurt am Main

CC-Holding GmbH 

Santander Direkt Bank AG 

Türkei/Turkey Akbank T.A.S. Niederlassung Deutschland

Isbank GmbH 

Yapi Kredi Bank (Deutschland) AG 

Ziraat Bank International AG 

USA American Express Bank GmbH 

Bank of America N.A. Military Banking Overseas Division

Bank of America, N.A. Filiale Frankfurt am Main

Citibank AG & Co. KGaA 

Citibank Privatkunden AG & Co. KGaA 

Citigroup Global Markets Deutschland AG & Co. KGaA 

Fidelity Investment Services GmbH 

Franklin Templeton Investment Services GmbH 

Goldman, Sachs & Co. OHG 

Instinet GmbH 

J.P. Morgan AG 

JP Morgan Fleming Investment GmbH 

JPMorgan Chase Bank Frankfurt Branch

Lehman Brothers Bankhaus AG 

Merrill Lynch Investment Managers Kapitalanlagegesellschaft mbH

Morgan Stanley Bank AG 

Pioneer Fonds Marketing GmbH 

State Street Bank GmbH 

The Bank of New York 
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